
Statute, Chapter III of 2009 
 
 
 

THE CHURCH OF IRELAND 
 

GENERAL SYNOD 2009 
 

ACT 
 

To amend Chapter XIV of the Constitution 
 

WHEREAS an increase in the annual total contribution made to the Church of Ireland Pensions 
Fund, established under Chapter XIV of the Constitution and hereinafter referred to as “the 
Fund”, is required to maintain the solvency of the Fund; 
 
AND WHEREAS for such purposes it is necessary to amend Chapter XIV of the Constitution; 
 
AND WHEREAS the Church of Ireland Pensions Board has certified that on the enactment of 
this Statute the Fund will remain compliant with the requirements of Section 16(1) of Chapter 
XIV of the Constitution; 
 
BE IT ENACTED by the Archbishops and Bishops and the Clergy and Laity of the Church of 
Ireland in General Synod assembled in Armagh in the year 2009, and by the authority of the 
same, as follows: 
 
1. In this Statute “Chapter XIV” means Chapter XIV of the Constitution of the Church of 

Ireland 2003. 

2. In Section 34 of Chapter XIV for “1st January 2008” there shall be substituted “1st January 
2010” and for the figure “22.4%” there shall be substituted the figure “26%”. 

3. (i)  In section 35(1) of Chapter XIV for the figure “5.6%” wherever it occurs there shall be 
substituted the figure “7.6%”.  

(ii) In section 35(1) of Chapter XIV for the figure “16.8%” wherever it occurs there shall be 
substituted the figure “18.4%”.  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 




